
No. S42 

19th. SEPTEMBER, 2009 

CONSTITUTION OF BRUNEI DARUSSALAM 
{Order made under Article 83(3)} 

STATUTORY FUNDS APPROPRIATION ENACTMENT {AMENDMENT} ORDER, 2009 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

Section 

1. Citation and commencement. 

2. Amendment of section 2 of Enactment No.9 of 1959. 

3. Amendment of Schedule. 

623 



BRUNEI DARUSSALAM GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

CONSTITUTION OF BRUNEI DARUSSALAM 
(Order made under Article 83(3)} 

STATUTORY FUNDS APPROPRIATION ENACTMENT (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2009 

In exercise of the power conferred by Article 83(3) of the Constitution of 
Brunei Darussalam, His Majesty the Sultan and Yang Di-Pertuan hereby makes 
the following Order -

Citation and commencement. 

1. This Order may cited as the Statutory Funds Appropriation Enactment 
(Amendment) Order, 2009. 

Amendment of section 2 of Enactment No. 9 of 1959. 

2. Section 2 of the Statutory Funds Appropriation Enactment, 1959, in this 
Order referred to as the Enactment, is amended by deleting "$10,373,372,491.96" 
and by substituting "$15,013,176,378.64" therefor. 

Amendment of Schedule. 

3. The Schedule to the Enactment is amended 

(a} by deleting "$9,445,886,491.96'' immediately after "Sustainability 
Fund" and by substituting "$14,085,690,378.64" therefor; 

(b) by deleting "$10,373,372,491.96" from the last line and by 
substituting "$15,013,176,378.64" therefor. 

Made this 18th. day of Ramadan, 1430 Hijriah corresponding to the 8th. day 
of September, 2009 at Our Istana Nurul Iman, Bandar Seri Begawan, 
Brunei Darussalam. 

HIS MAJESTY 
THE SULTAN AND YANG DI-PERTUAN 

BRUNEI DARUSSALAM 

Dicetak oleh PENGIRAN HAJI ZAINAL ABIDIN BIN PENGIRAN SERI WIJAYA 
PENGIRAN HAJI AHMAD, Pemangku Pengarah Percetakan, 

di Jabatan Percetakan Kerajaan, Bandar Seri Begawan BB3510, Negara Brunei Darussalam. 

Harga B$5.00 




